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William Frederick "Buffalo Bill" Cody was a legendary figure of the
American West. A skilled hunter, frontiersman, and showman, Cody played
a pivotal role in shaping the public's perception of the Wild West. His
memoir, My Sixty Years On The Plains, is a captivating account of his
extraordinary life and adventures on the American frontier.

Born in Iowa in 1846, Cody grew up on the rugged frontier. At a young age,
he became an expert hunter, providing meat for his family and neighbors.
In 1863, he joined the Union Army and served as a scout during the Civil
War. After the war, Cody returned to the frontier and became a buffalo
hunter. He earned his nickname "Buffalo Bill" after killing over 4,000 buffalo
in 18 months.
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In the 1870s, Cody began his career as a showman. He organized the Wild
West Show, which toured the United States and Europe. The show
featured cowboys, Indians, and other characters from the frontier. Cody's
show was a huge success, and he became one of the most famous men in
the world.

My Sixty Years On The Plains is Cody's firsthand account of his life on the
frontier. The book is full of adventure, excitement, and humor. Cody writes
about his experiences as a buffalo hunter, his service in the Union Army,
and his career as a showman. He also provides insights into the lives of the
Native Americans and the other people who lived on the frontier.

My Sixty Years On The Plains is a valuable historical document and a
fascinating read for anyone interested in the American West. Cody's
memoir is a testament to his courage, determination, and showmanship. It
is a must-read for anyone who wants to learn more about one of the most
iconic figures in American history.

Here are some of the key highlights of My Sixty Years On The Plains:

Cody's vivid descriptions of the American frontier

His firsthand account of the buffalo hunts

His experiences as a scout during the Civil War

His career as a showman

His insights into the lives of the Native Americans

If you are interested in the American West, then you will love My Sixty
Years On The Plains. Cody's memoir is a captivating read that will transport



you back to a time of adventure and excitement.

Free Download your copy of My Sixty Years On The Plains today!
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