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Public administration and public policy are facing unprecedented
challenges in the 21st century. From the rise of populism and nationalism to
the impact of technology on government, from the challenges of climate
change to the changing nature of work, the world is facing a rapidly
changing landscape. This book brings together leading scholars from
around the world to discuss the most pressing issues facing public
administration and public policy today.
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The book is divided into five parts, each of which focuses on a different
challenge facing public administration and public policy. The first part, "The
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Rise of Populism and Nationalism," examines the causes and
consequences of the rise of populism and nationalism around the world.
The second part, "The Impact of Technology on Government," explores the
ways in which technology is changing the way that governments operate
and interact with citizens. The third part, "The Challenges of Climate
Change," examines the challenges that climate change poses for public
administration and public policy, and discusses the ways in which
governments can mitigate the effects of climate change.

The fourth part, "The Changing Nature of Work," examines the ways in
which the changing nature of work is affecting public administration and
public policy. The fifth part, "The Need for Greater Diversity and Inclusion in
Public Service," examines the importance of diversity and inclusion in
public service, and discusses the ways in which governments can create
more diverse and inclusive workplaces.

This book is an essential resource for anyone who is interested in public
administration and public policy. It provides a comprehensive overview of
the challenges facing the field, and offers valuable insights into the ways in
which these challenges can be addressed.
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About the Author

[Author Name] is a leading scholar in the field of public administration and
public policy. He has written extensively on the challenges facing public
administration and public policy in the 21st century, and his work has been
published in some of the top journals in the field. He is currently a professor
of public administration at [University Name].
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